
“Wake me up when 
September ends…”

That’s tomorrow! No time for snoozing. 
Bring on October and this week’s scoop.


Fall Festival

Sat, Sept 23rd


The Fall Festival was a hit! Loads of kids in 
painted faces, bouncing off walls (literally), 
riding trains, dancing in socks, inhaling donuts; 
parents eating yummy tacos, carrying bags of 
live fish and mingling in the beer tent. Cheers to 
the live entertainment, btw. Did I mention the live 
fish? Thanks to committee members: Elizabeth 
Koenig, Susan LeRoy, Natalee Allington, Laura 
Bastuba, Vanessa Kenaya, Natalia Tarnavsky-
Smith and Adriana VanDuyn, and to all the 
additional volunteers, for your hard work!
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Quick Links

  About Us                                    
Volunteer                                                                 

Events                                             
Contact Us


Next PTG Membership 
Meeting


10/10 - 9:15 am - North Campus


In this issue… 
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FALL FESTIVAL

50/50 RAFFLE

FALL FLOWER SALE  

TRUNK OR TREAT

EVENT DATES

RETAIL FUNDRAISERS

https://www.holyfam.org/hfrsptg/about-us.cfm
https://www.holyfam.org/hfrsptg/volunteer.cfm
https://www.holyfam.org/hfrsptg/events.cfm
mailto:hfrsptgpres@gmail.com


50/50 Raffle

UNCLAIMED #436000


The winning raffle ticket is UNCLAIMED. Dig in 
your back pockets and sift through the trash to 
check your numbers!! The winning ticket is 
green #436000. Contact us if you have the 
match. If the ticket isn’t claimed by Monday, the 
funds will be donated to the PTG.


Fall Flower Sale

A lot of porches are about to get festive, thanks 
to our Fall Flower Sale and Megan Wilson, who 
organized the event. Both campuses are also in 
bloom, as the PTG has added mums to brighten 
your pick up and drop off. Enjoy!


Trunk or Treat

Fri, Oct 20th


Trick out your haunted hot rod and meet us at 
South Campus for Trunk or Treat fun! Tickets 
are available until October 16th. Brave 
volunteers can sign up here.* See attached flyer 
for more details…if you dare.


*Sign up opens at 5 pm tonight.


Event Dates!

Looking for them? Head to our Events page and 
start marking your calendars. (Pro Tip: This link 
can always be found on the top right column of 
this newsletter.)


*Dates are tentative and subject to change.


Retail Fundraisers

Box Tops Spotlight


Does your family eat cereal? Enjoy snacks and 
bottled water? Do you know there are hundreds 
of Box Top products? Not just edible ones; 
household cleaning and office supplies have 
scannable box tops too! See attached flyer for a 
reminder of how EASY it is to contribute, using 
products you already buy…


Busch’s, Kroger, RaiseRight, Toyology

Click on the links above for more info on our 
other programs! Want to get involved? We are 
currently looking for 2 co-chairs to run these 
programs.
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PTG Executive Board


Presidents:                                    

Lauren Kochenderfer  


Kristen Baradihi      

Vice Presidents:                                     

Christina Scollin 

Chelsea George


  Secretary: 

Christina Matway                              


Treasurer:                                                   

Dena Premo

“Teamwork makes the DREAM work.”

mailto:hfrsptgtreas@gmail.com?subject=50/50%20Raffle%20Ticket
https://payit.nelnet.net/form/OJShH5Wk
https://www.signupgenius.com/go/10C084CA9AC2AA4FA7-hfrs5#/
https://www.holyfam.org/hfrsptg/events.cfm
https://4.files.edl.io/56e6/08/28/19/154210-13c51d7c-6e70-4b18-8706-eedea810e71e.pdf
https://www.buschs.com/community
https://www.holyfam.org/editoruploads/files/PTG/2022%20-%202023/PTG%20-%20Kroger%20Flyer.pdf
https://www.raiseright.com
https://www.holyfam.org/editoruploads/files/PTG/2022%20-%202023/PTG%20-%20Toyology%20fundraiser.pdf
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